
NAVIGATING SEASONAL HAZARDS AND YOUR HOME INSURANCE

SPRING SUMMER

AUTUMN WINTER

Flood Insurance: Standard homeowners’ insurance does 
not cover flood damage. If you live in a flood-prone area, 
it’s crucial to purchase a separate flood insurance 
policy,often available through the National Flood 
Insurance Program (NFIP).

Risk Mitigation: Clearing gutters and ensuring proper 
drainage can help minimize water damage. 

Wind and Storm Damage: Ensure your homeowner’s 
insurance covers wind damage, especially if you live in 
coastal areas.

Emergency Preparedness: Prepare an emergency kit and 
establish a family communication plan. 

Review Your Policy: Check if you need additional coverage 
for specific perils, such as sewer backup or debris removal.

Wildfire Risk:  Standard homeowners’ insurance typically 
covers fire, but additional endorsements might be 
necessary for comprehensive protection. 

Defensible Space: Creating defensible space around your 
home not only helps protect your property but can also 
reduce insurance premiums.

Policy Review: Consider a wildfire-specific policy or 
endorsement, especially if you live in a high-risk zone. This 
can provide additional coverage for structures and 
personal property in the event of a fire.  

Common Risks: Frozen pipes, ice dams, and roof collapses 
are prevalent issues during winter. 

Insurance Coverage: Most standard policies cover burst 
pipes and roof damage due to snow. However, it’s essential 
to check for exclusions or limits in your policy, some policies 
may have caps on how much they will pay for these.

Preventative Measures: Insulating pipes and maintaining 
your roof can prevent claims. Notify your insurer of any 
significant upgrades, such as a new roof, which could lead 
to premium reductions. 

Summer storms and hurricanes can cause extensive damage. 

Winter can be harsh, bringing snow, ice, and freezing 
temperatures that pose significant risks to your home. 

Fall can bring risks of wildfires, especially in certain regions. 

Spring often brings heavy rainfall, raising the risk of flooding. 


